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The most relevant economic data…

Event/Period Unit Banorte Survey Previous A glimpse to the main financial assets

Eurozone

Trade balance* - Jul Equity indices

United States S&P 500 Futures

Initial jobless claims* - Sep 10 Euro Stoxx 50

Empire manufacturing* - Sep Nikkei 225

Advance retail sales* - Aug Shanghai Composite

   Ex autos & gas* - Aug Currencies

   Control group* - Aug USD/MXN

Philadelphia Fed* - Sep EUR/USD

Industrial production* - Aug DXY

Manufacturing production* - Aug Commodities

China WTI

Industrial production - Aug Brent

Retail sales - Aug Gold

Gross fixed investment (YTD) - Aug Copper

Sovereign bonds

10-year Treasury

Source: Bloomberg
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-0.1%
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8:30 thousands 230 225 222

5:00 EURbn  -- -32.3 -30.8

3.45This document is provided for the reader’s convenience only. The translation from the original Spanish version was made by Banorte’s staff. Discrepancies may possibly arise between the original document in Spanish and its 

English translation. For this reason, the original research paper in Spanish is the only official document. The Spanish version was released before the English translation. The original document entitled “Apertura de Mercados 

Financieros” was released earlier today.

Source: Bloomberg and Banorte. (P) preliminary data; (R) revised data; (F) final data; * Seasonally adjusted, ** Seasonally adjusted annualized rate.
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• Mixed stock markets, S&P Futures down, stable USD and government bond
yields up, with investors awaiting important US economic data today, and
readjusting their expectations on future Fed action, as well as its impact on
the economy going forward

• In the US, retail sales and industrial production for August will be released, as
well as the regional Empire manufacturing and Philly Fed surveys for
September. The data will be key to see if there is already an impact of Fed’s
aggressive rate hike cycle

• A tentative agreement has been reached between the rail companies and
unions representing more than 100,000 workers to avoid a shutdown. This
lessens concerns of additional supply chain disruptions and avoids a negative
impact on Biden's approval ahead of the midterm elections

• The US Senate approved a bill to finance arms to Taiwan. Chinese President
Xi Jinping and Vladimir Putin are meeting at the Uzbekistan summit.
Meanwhile, the central bank in China decided to keep the rate unchanged at
2.75% after a 10bp cut in August Winners of the award for best economic 

forecasters for Mexico in 2021, granted 
by Refinitiv
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Equities Previous closing levels

Equity indices

Dow Jones

S&P 500

Nasdaq

IPC

Ibovespa

Euro Stoxx 50

FTSE 100

CAC 40

DAX

Nikkei 225

Hang Seng

Shanghai Composite

Sovereign bonds

2-year Treasuries

10-year Treasuries

Sovereign fixed income, currencies and commodities 28-day Cetes

28-day TIIE

2-year Mbono

10-year Mbono

Currencies

USD/MXN

EUR/USD

GBP/USD

DXY

Commodities

WTI

Brent

Mexican mix

Gold

Copper

Source: Bloomberg
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• Mexarrend announced it received the final approval of a line of credit with
Banco Azteca for MXN 600 million, collateralized by real estate assets. Thus,
Mexarrend ended the refinancing of its bond maturity due October 2022

• Fitch Ratings resolved the Negative Watch on ION Financiera’s long- and
short-term ratings and affirmed them at ‘BBB(mex)’ and ‘F3(mex)’. The long-
term outlook is Negative. The rating actions were based on the company’s
received capital contributions that have kept its tangible leverage metrics in
levels close to 6.0x, despite the consistent net losses and the lower-than-
expected portfolio sales

• CEMEX announced a Tender Offer for its Notes 3.875% due 2031, its Notes
5.200% due 2030 and its notes 5.450% due 2029 for a total purchase amount
of US$400 million

• Negative balance in sovereign bonds. European rates adjust up to +4bps. 
Meanwhile, the Treasury curve with pressures of 4bps, on average. Yesterday, 
the Mbonos curve adjusted +6bps, on average, with the 10-year benchmark at 
9.08% (+5bps)

• The dollar trades little changed, while developed currencies trade with mixed 
returns with GBP (-0.4%) as the weakest. In EM, the bias is negative with 
RUB (+0.7%) and CLP (-0.9%) at the extremes. Meanwhile, MXN depreciates 
0.4% to 20.02 per dollar

• Crude-oil fall 1.0%, on average, as markets assess demand in China and a 
possible increase in its share of fuel exports. Metals trade with negative bias 
with gold and copper down 0.8% and 0.9%, respectively

• Mixed stock markets as investors seem torn between, on one hand, among
negative sentiment, supported by an environment of greater monetary
tightening. And, on the other hand, deep buyers, who continue to bet on
inflation’s peak

• The US anticipates a slightly downward opening with S&P 500 futures trading
0.2% below their theoretical value while awaiting the release of some economic
data. As for Europe, it is trading mostly to the downside, however, the
Eurostoxx remains without a clear trend, decreasing 0.1%, and with real estate
sector leading losses with 1.9%. Finally, Asia closed mixed, highlighting the
Hang Seng’s advance of 0.4%, after China lifted blockades in most parts of
Chengdu

• In Mexico, the Mexbol Index closed yesterday at 46,745pts and today might
hoover around 46,500pts
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